
 
 
 
 

 

The City of Burlingame 
CITY HALL — (650) 696-7230 
PUBLIC WORKS — 501 PRIMROSE ROAD 
BURLINGAME, CALIFORNIA  94010-3997 

WWW.BURLINGAME.ORG CORPORATION YARD — (650) 558-7670 
1361 NORTH CAROLAN AVENUE 

BURLINGAME, CALIFORNIA  94010-2401 

   

Bid Summary  
 
James Ford Inc.  
7/31/2025 via email –  
100 Seymour Street, PO Box 426, Half Moon Bay, CA 94019 
Daniel Hamren, 650-726-4496 
 
Serramonte Ford  
7/31/2025 via email –  
999 Serramonte Boulevard, Colma, CA 94014 
Vaseem Mohammed, 650-301-7100 
 
Towne Ford 
7/25/2025 via email –  
643 Bair Island Road, Suite 300, Redwood City, CA 94063 
Jorge Ibarra-Bravo, 650-619-4081 
 
Putnam Ford – No bid 
885 North San Mateo Drive, San Mateo, CA 94401 
Castulo Herrera- 650-931-3121 
7/24/2025 via email requesting bid  
7/30/2025 via email, received unable to bid response 
 
Sonsray Machinery (Sourcewell) 
1450 Doolittle Drive, San Leandro, CA 94577  
Ricardo Contreras, 510-562-0653 
 
Belkorp Ag,LLC (Sourcewell) 
2715 Lafayette Street, Santa Clara, CA 95050  
Jim Sherman, 408-727-5660 
 
 
 
 



Two 2026 Ford F-350 Super Duty with Dump bed conversion (7467 and 7469)   
 
Company Name Bid Amount 
Towne Ford $ 151,508.14 ($75,754.07 each) 
James Ford Inc.  $ 154,899.92 ($77,449.96 each)  
Serramonte Ford $ 148,910.02 ($74,455.01 each) 
Putnam Ford No Bid 

 
Recommended Award: Serramonte Ford Amount: $ 148,910.02 ($74,455.01 each) 
 
 
   
Three 2025 Ford F-150 Lightning EV (20, 32 and 7489 ) 
 
Company Name Bid Amount 
Towne Ford $ 169,303.38 ($56,434.46 each) 
James Ford Inc.  $ 182,409.06 ($60,803.02 each) 
Serramonte Ford $ 173,792.55 ($57,930.85 each) 
Putnam Ford No Bid 

 
Recommended Award: Towne Ford  Amount: $ 169,303.38 ($56,434.46 each) 
 
 
 
One 2025 Ford Ranger (1) 
 
Company Name Bid Amount 
Towne Ford $ 37,307.09  
James Ford Inc.  $ 38,523.43 
Serramonte Ford $ 36,610.98 
Putnam Ford No Bid 

 
Recommended Award: Serramonte Ford Amount: $ 36,610.98 
 
 
 
One 2025 Case 580 Super N (Acquired through Sourcewell Contract #011723-CNH) 
 
Company Name Bid Amount 
Sonsray Machinery  $ 168,390.66  

 
 
One 2025 John Deere 344 P-Tier Compact Loader (Acquired through Sourcewell Contract 
#011723) 
 
Company Name Bid Amount 
Belkorp AG, LLC  $ 194,212.67  
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